
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 13-1547

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Purchase of One Horizontal Split-Case Centrifugal Pump for the Seale Pump

FOR: Station and One for the Southcross Pump Station

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 31, 2013
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM 1 PUMP FOR SEALE PUMP STATION UNIT   

1 ea. PRICE   

1. Horizontal Split-Case Centrifugal Pump TOTAL 15,829.00 29,860.10 NO BID

 UNIT   

1 LS PRICE   

2. Spare Parts TOTAL 5,458.00 2,500.00 NO BID

 UNIT   

1 LS PRICE   

3. Manufacturer's Field Services TOTAL 948.00 1,000.00 NO BID

UNIT

1 LS PRICE

4. Manufacturer's Warranty (2 Years) TOTAL N/A 2,500.00 NO BID

1 LS UNIT   

Freight to Seale Pump Station PRICE   

5. 254 Seale Rd., San Antonio, TX 78219 TOTAL N/A 1,000.00 NO BID

UNIT *  

 PRICE   

ITEM 1 TOTAL TOTAL 22,235.00 36,860.10 NO BID

UNIT   

 PRICE Aurora Fairbanks Morse

Make and Model TOTAL 410-8x10x17B 2800 HSC

ITEM 2 PUMP FOR SOUTHCROSS PUMP STATION DOES NOT 

1 ea. MEET

1. Horizontal Split-Case Centrifugal Pump SPECIFICATIONS 28,642.15 33,149.0

 UNIT DOES NOT  

1 LS PRICE MEET  

2. Spare Parts TOTAL SPECIFICATIONS 2,500.00 9,680.0

 UNIT DOES NOT 

1 LS PRICE MEET

3. Manufacturer's Field Services TOTAL SPECIFICATIONS 1,000.00 1,600.0

UNIT DOES NOT 

1 LS PRICE MEET

4. Manufacturer's Warranty (2 Years) TOTAL SPECIFICATIONS 2,500.00 0.0

1 LS DOES NOT 

Freight to Southcross Pump Station MEET

5. 6019 S. Zarzamora, San Antonio, TX 78211 SPECIFICATIONS 1,000.00 1,000.0

DOES NOT *

 MEET

ITEM 2 TOTAL SPECIFICATIONS 35,642.15 45,429.00

 Crane Deming Deming 

Make and Model 5064 5064

Net Net Net

 Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days

Item 1: 90 days Item 1: 180 days

Delivery Days  Item 2: 90 days Item 2: 126 days

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 Odessa Pump Co. Demandstar

Pump Solutions SAWS Website

Smith Pump Co.                                                                   
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